
Reigniting Our Heritage 
 Let everything that has breath praise the LORD. Praise ye the LORD. 

Psalms 150:6 

We praise you our Lord...  

In March of this year, the FSBC family voted to proceed with a major remodel and res-
toration project. This included a significant renovation of the existing foyer that more than 
doubled its size; an extreme remodel of the sanctuary that resulted in a new stage, sound 
booth, ceiling, carpeting covering all block walls with insulation, sheetrock, and new paint. 
Restoration of the education wing resulted in covering the block wall, new paint and carpet. 
Outdoors, we were blessed to be able to pave and stripe the parking lot, stucco the entire 
building, and accenting it with new paint and color schemes on all the exterior trim.  Our pro-
ject theme, Reigniting Our Heritage, grew out of respect and recognition for the many years 
of faithful church ministry while we waited for the Lord to lead us into the project. By mid-
April all the funding, architectural work, and permits were in place. Around May first we be-
gan the project. On September 8th we held our rededication service in the newly remodeled 
sanctuary. Many of our readers, most of whom have worshipped here in years past and still 
considered part of our extended church family, helped underwrite this project. I cannot ade-
quately express to you my thanks. God has truly blessed FSBC and he used many of you to do 
it.  

 

We praise you our Lord… 

We are now entering our final stage of remodel. We are appealing to our church fami-
ly and extended church family to help us get over the finish line. We need an additional 
$10,000.00 to complete the Fellowship Hall makeover. This will include a new classroom, 
storage room, expanded and remodeled kitchen, paint and floor coverings. Please pray about 
helping meet this financial need.  

If you are led to contribute financially, make your check payable to FSBC and mark it, 
Remodel Project. Send it to First Sothern Baptist Church, 1400 N 3rd E, Mountain Home, ID. 
83647. Thank in advance for your ministry partnership and contribution to this specific need. 

I hope you enjoy the pictures of our Phase 1 project. If you would like a 15-minute 
DVD of the project (from start to finish), call the church at (209) 587-3828 and we will send it 
to you. 

 

To God be the Glory, 

Pastor Jim 
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